13,

c.
d.
e.

MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
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- Award bid(s) for the purchase of the following for county precincts:
a.
b.

Road paving;

AC-5 asphalt, AG-10 asphalt, CRS-2 emulsion, MC-30 road oil, and seal coat sealers or proven
equal;

Road materials;

Herbicides; and

Culverts.

Motion by Commissioner Gertson to approve awarding the bids for the purchase of the

following for county precincts Road Pavings; AC-5 asphalt, AC-10 asphalt, CRS-2

emulsion, MC-30 road oii, and seal coat sealers or proven equal; Road materials;

Herbicides; Based on price, availability, quality and location; seconded by Commissioner

Neuendorif; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered. Discussion followed.

Motion by Commissioner Neuendorff to deny the Culverts bid; Réymie Kana, County

Auditor advised that we can reject the bid and have a rebid; seconded by Commissioner

Kubesch; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered.

(See Attachment)

MINUTES OF THE COLORADGC COUNTY
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BID TABULATION FOR ROAD MATERIALS
OPENED PUBLICLY MARCH 9, 2022 AT 2:00 P.M.
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2022 TO MARCH 31, 2023

i. Cover Rock

i Plant
PCT. #1 3/8 Dia, 5/8 Dia. Picked Up Location
Colorado Materials §47.00 $47.00 $27.00/$27.00 [ New Braunfels, TX
Alleyton Resource Co. No bid No bid $17.00/817.00 | Varous County Areas
Green Dream International $64.61 $77.56 $40.98/842.08 | Katy or Humble, TX
*Martin Marieita
Plant
PCT. #2 3/8Dia. | 5/8Dia, | Picked Up Laocation
Colorado Materials $42.50 $42.50 $27.00/$27.00 | New Braunfels, TX
Alleyton Resource Co. No bid No bid $17.00/§17.00 | Various Couvnty Areas
Green Dream Intemational $64.61 $77.56 $40.98/842.08 | Katy or Humble, Tx
*Mvlartin Marietta
Plant
PCT.#3 3/8 Dia. 5/8 Dia. Picked Up Location
Colorado Materials $46.50 $46.50 $27.00/$27.00 | New Braunfels, TX
Alleyton Resource Co. No bid No bid $17.00/817.00 | Various County Areas
Green Dream International £64.61 $77.56 $40.98/542.08 | Katy or Humble, TX
*Martin Marietta
Plant
PCT. #4 3/8 Dia. 5/8 Dia. Picked Up Location
Colorado Materials $48.00 $48.00 $27.00/$27.00 | New Braunfels, TX
Alleyton Resource Co. No bid No bid $17.00/817.00 | Various County Areas
Green Dream International $58.75 $77.56 £40.98/542.08 | Katy or Humble, TX
*Martin Marietta
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B. Pit run

-

P(;T. #1 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Prihoda Gravel Co. $9.15 $4.40 Altair, TX Area
Zhranek Gravel $9.75 $4.75 Altair, TX

PCT. #2 Price Del. To Pct: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Prihoda Gravel Co. $10.35 $4.40 Altair, TX Area
Zbranek Gravel $11.00 $4.75 Altair, TX

PCT. 43 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Y.ocation:
Prihoda Gravel Co. $10.95 $4.40 Altair, TX Area
Zbranek Gravel $11.50 34.75 Alfair, TX

PCT, #4 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Prihoda Gravel Co, $9.15 $4.40 Altair, TX Area
Zbranek Gravel $9.75 $4.75 Altair, TX
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3. 2" & UNDER SCREEN PIT RUN

PCT. #1 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Prihoda Gravel Co. $11.10 $6.45 Altair, TX Area
Zbranek Gravel £11.75 $6.75 Altair, TX

PCT. #2 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Prihoda Gravel Co. $12.40 §£6.45 Altair, TX Area
Zbranek Gravel $13.00 $6.75 Altair, TX

PCT. #3 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Prihoda Gravel Co. $12.85 $6.45 Altair, TX Area
Zbranek Gravel $13.50 $6.75 Altair, TX

PCT. #4 Price Del. Tg Pet: Picked Ugp: Plant Location:
Prikoda Gravel Co. $11.10 $6.45 Altair, TX Area
Zbranek Gravel $11.75 $6.75 Altair, TX
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4, Post Oak

PCT. #1 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Barten Co No bid $15.00 Columbus, TX
PCT. #2 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Barten Co. No bid $15.00 Columbus, TX

PCT. #3 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Barten Co. No bid $15.00 Columbus, TX

PCT. i#4 Price Del. To Pet: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Barten Co. No bid $15.00 Columbus, TX
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5. Limestone

Plant
PCT. #1 /2> 1* 1% Picked Up Location
Colorado Materials Mo bid $26.50 $25.50 NB/36/85 New Braunfels, TX
Colorado Materials No bid No bid $25.50 NB/NB/$19.50 | Glidden, TX
Prihoda Gravel Co. No bid No bid No bid 29.75720.75/25.75 | Altair, TX Area
Bemarde Trucking $23.00 $23.00 $23.00 NB/NB/NB
Brauntex Materials No bid No bid No bid $6.1546.7385.75 | New Braunfels, TX
Vulcan Construction Co. No bid $37.24 No bid NB/$11.50/NB | San Antonio, TX
Quality Hot Mix $24.00 Nao bid $24.00 $24/NB/$24 New Taiton, TX
Green Dream Intemational No bid No bid $£45.77 NB/NB/$29.15 | Rosenberg, TX
Plant
PCT. #2 1/2” 1» 13" Picked Up Location
Colorado Materials No bid $22.00 $21.00 NB/S6/SS New Braunfels, TX
Colorado Materials No bid No bid $23.50 NB/MANB/$19.50 | Glidden, TX
Prihoda Gravel Co, No Bid No bid No bid 20.7522.75/23.75 | Altair, TX Area
Bemardo Trucking $22.00 $22.00 $22.00 NB/NB/NB
Brauntex Materials Mo bid No bid No bid $6.25/36.75/35.75 | Altair, TX
Vulcan Construction Co. No bid $32.59 No bid NB/E11.50/NB | San Antonio, TX
Quality Hot Mix $24.00 No bid $24.00 $24/NB/$24 New Taiton, TX
Green Dream International Mo bid No bid $52.78 NB/ANB/$29.15 | Rosenberg, TX
Plant
PCT. #3 1/2* 1* 13%» Picked Up Location
Colorado Materials No bid $26.00 $25.00 NB/$6/85 New Braunfels, TX
Colorado Materials No bid No bid $25.00 NB/MNB/$19.50 | Glidden, TX
Prihoda Gravel Co. No bid No bid No bid 20.75729.7525.75 | Altair, TX Area
Bernardo Trucking $£23.00 $23.00 $23.00 NB/NB/NB
Brauntex Materials No bid No bid Mo bid $6.25/86.75/85.75 | New Braunfels, TX
Vulcan Construetion Co. No bid $37.24 No bid NB/$11.50/NB | San Antonio, TX
| Quality Hot Mix $24.00 No bid $24.00 $24/NB/524 New Taiton, TX
Green Dream Intemational Wo bid No bid $£52.78 NB/MB/$29.15 | Rosenberg, TX
Plant
PCT. #4 1/2» 1» 13%” Picked Up Location
Colorado Materials No bid $27.50 $26.50 NB/36/ES5 New Braunfels, TX.
Colorado Materials No bid No bid $26.30 NB/NB/$19.50 | Glidden, TX
Prihoda Grave! Co. No bid No bid No bid 29.75129.75/25.75 | Altair, TX Area
Bernarde Trucking $23.50 $23.50 $23.50 NB/NB/INB
Brauntex Materials No bid No bid No bid $6.25/36.75/85.75 | New Braunfels, TX
Vulcan Construction Co, No bid $38.09 No bid NB/511.50/NB | San Antonio, TX
uality Hot Mix 32400 No bid $24.00 $24/NB/$24 New Taiton, TX
Green Dream International No bid No bid $43.35 NB/NB/$29.15 | Rosenberg, TX
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6. Lime —~ Pebbled Lime, Delivered & Applisd at Job Site

Pret.1 |Prct. 2 Pret. 3 Pret. 4
Bidder
Texas Lime Company $241.00 $241.00 $241.00 $241.00
¥24 ton minimum truckload
Austin White Lime Company $160.36 $160.36 $160.36 $160.36
*22 ton minimum truckload

7. Lime — Hydrated Lime, 50 Ibs. Sacks - Delivered to Joh Site or Pick up

Price Del. To Pct: Picked Up: Plant Location:
Texas Lime Company $7.65 $6.00 Cleburne, TX
*22.50 ton minimum truclkload
Austin White Lime Company $5.53 $4.52 NeNeil, TX

*del price per S0# sacks; 1000 bags per trk
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8. Limestone: Grade 4 Washed

Pct. #1 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materials $47.00 $27.00 New Braunfels, TX
Bemardo Trucking $36.00 No bid
Brauntex Materials No bid $22.00 New Braunfels, TX
Quality Hot Mix $35.00 $42.50 Mew Taiton, TX

| Green Dream Intemnational $57.60 $40.98 Rosenberg, TX
Pct. #2 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up [ Plant Location
Colorado Materials $42.50 $27.00 New Braunfels, TX
Bemardo Trucking $35.00 No bid
Brauntex Materials Mo bid $22.00 MNew Braunfels, TX
Quality Hot Mix $33.00 $42.50 New Taiton, TX
Green Dream International $64.61 $40.98 Rosenberg, TX
Pct. #3 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materials $46.50 $27.00 MNew Braunfels, TX
Bemardo Trucking $36.00 No bid
Brauntex Materials Mo bid $22.00 New Braunfels, TX
Quality Hot Mix $35.00 $42.50 New Taiton, Tx
Green Drearmn International $64.61 $40.98 Rosenberg, TX
Pct. #4 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorade Materials $48.00 $27.00 New Braunfels, TX
Bemardo Trucking $36.50 Mo bid
Brauntex Materials No bid $22.00 New Braunfels, TX
Quality Hot Mix $35.00 $42.50 New Taiton, TX
Green Dream Intemnational $55.18 $40.98 Rosenberg, TX
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9. Limestone: Grade 5 Washed

Pct. #1 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorade Materiak $47.00 $27.00 New Braunfels, TX
Brauntex Materials No bid $22.00 New Braunfels, TX
Quality Hot Mix $45.00 $£50.00 New Tatton, TX
Green Dream Intemational $57.60 $40.98 Rosenberg, TX
Pct. #2 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materials $42.50 $27.00 New Braunfels, TX
Brauntex Materials No bid $22.00 New Braunfels, TX
Quality Hot Mix $43.00 $50.00 New Taiton, TX
Green Dream International $64.61 $40.98 Rosenberg, TX
Pct. #3 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materials $46.50 $27.00 New Brannfels, TX
Brauntex Materials No bid $22.00 New Braunfels, TX
Quality Hot Mix $45.00 $50.00 New Taiton, TX
Green Dream Interpational £64.61 $40.98 Rosenberg, TX
Pct. #4 Prico per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materials $48.00 $27.00 New Braunfels, TX
Brauntex Materials No bid $22.00 New Braunfels, TX
Quality Hot Mix $45.00 $50.00 New Taiton, Tx
Green Dream International $55.18 $40.98 Rosenberg, TX
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10. Recycied Cement Stabilized Base

Pct. #1 Price per ton del, to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Pct. #2 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Pct. #3 Price per ton del. to Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Pct. #4 Price per ton del. to Pet. | Picked Up | Plant Location
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11.  Freight —~ Price per ton per mile

Prct.1 |Prct. 2 Prct. 3 Prct. 4
Bidder

Prihoda Gravel Co. $0.26 $0.26 $0.26 $0.26
Zbranek Gravel No bid No bid No bid No bid
Bemardo Trucking $0.23 $0.23 $0.23 $0.23
Quality Hot Mix $0.24 3$0.24 $0.24 $0.24

Freight — Price per yard per mile

Prct. 1 Prct. 2 Prct. 3 Prct. 4

Bidder

Prihoda Gravel Co. $0.26 $0.25 $0.26 30.26
Zbranek Gravel $0.20 $0.20 $0.20 $0.20
Bernardo Trucking §0.28 $0.28 $0.28 $0.28
Quality Hot Mix No bid No bid No bid No bid
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12, Portland Cement — 94 |bs. bags

Price per 94 lbs bags

Pct, #1 delivered Picked Up Plant Location
Price per 94 per bags

Pet. #2 delivered Picked Up | Plant Location

Price per 24 lbs bags
Pct. #3 delivered Picked Up

Piant Location

Price per ton picked up
Pct. #4 your plant Picked Up

Plant Location
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13. Road Mix
Price per ton delivered

Pet. #1 Picked Up | Plant Location
Bemardo Trucking 321.00 No bid

Price per ton picked up
Pct. #2 your plant Picked Up Plant Location
Bemardo Trucking $21.00 No bid

Price per ton picked up
Pct. #3 your plant Picked Up Plant Location
Bemardo Trucking $21.00 No bid

Price per ton picked up
Pct. #4 your plant Picked Up Plant Location
Bermardo Trucking $21.00 No bid
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14. Hot Mix - Cold Laid, Asphaltic Concrete Pavement THD#334 Type D

Pct, #1 Price per fon del. To Pct. Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materinls $90.00 $69.00 New Braunfels, TX
Brauntex Materials No bid $76.00 New Braunfels, TX
Waller County Asphalt $89.50 $70.00 Hempstead, TX
Quality Hot Mix $84.00 £76.00 New Taiton, TX
Pct., #2 Price per ton del. To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materials $85.50 $69.00 New Braunfels, TX
Brauntex Materials No bid $76.00 New Braunfels, TX
Waller County Asphalt $89.00 S70.00 Hempstead, TX
Quality Hot Mix $80.00 $76.00 New Taiton, TX
Pct. #3 Price per ton del. To Pet. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materials $89.50 $69.00 New Braunfels, TX
Brauntex Materials No bid £76.00 New Braunfels, TX
Waller County Asphalt $82.00 $70.00 Hempstead, TX
Quality Hot Mix $84.00 $76.00 New Taiton, TX
Pct. #4 Price per ton dei. To Pet. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Colorado Materials $91.00 $69.00 New Braunfels, TX
Brauntex Materials No bid $76.00 New Braunfels, TX
Waller County Asphalt $82.50 $70.00 Hempstead, TX
Quality Hot Mix $84.00 $76.00 New Taiton, TX

13
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45. Cold Mix — Limestone Rock Asphait Pavement THD#330 Type D

Pct. #1 Price per ton del. To Pct. Picked Up | Plant L.ocation
Bemardo Trucking $87.50 No bid

Vulean Construction Co. $104.60 plus fuel surcharge $59.00 Uvalde, TX

Waller County Asphalt $89.50 £70.00 Hempstead, TX
Pct. #2 Price per ton del. To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Bemardo Trucking $86.50 No bid

Vulcan Construction Co. $99.85 plus fuel surcharge $59.00 Uvalde, TX

Waller County Asphalt $89.00 §7000 Hempstead, TX
Pct. #3 Price per ton del. To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Bernardo Trucking $87.50 No bid

Vulcan Construction Co. $105.55 plus fuel surcharge £59.00 Uvalde, TX

‘Waller County Asphalt £82.00 $70.00 Hempstead, TX
Pct. #4 Price per ton del. To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Bernarde Trucking $88.00 No bid

Vulean Construction Co. $105.55 plus fuel surcharge $59.00 TUvyalde, TX

Waller County Asphalt $82.50 $70.80 Hempstead, TX
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16. Cold Mix — High Performance Patching Material THD#ASPPM 9202 Type IV

Pct. #1 Price per ton del. To Pct. Picked Up | Plant Location
Waller County Asphalt $110.50 $91.00 Hempstead, TX
Pct. #2 Price per ton del. To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
‘Waller County Asphalt $110.00 $91.00 Hempstead, TX
Pct. #3 Price per ton del: To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Waller County Asphalt $103.00 $91.00 Hempstead, TX
Pct. #4 Price per ton del. To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
‘Waller County Asphalt $103.50 $91.00 Hempstead, Tx
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17. HotMix — Asphaltic Concrete Pavement THD#340 Type D

Pct. #1 Price per ton del. To Pct. Picked Up | Plant Location
Brauntex Materials No bid $62.00 New Braunfels, TX
Waller County Asphalt $86.50 $67.00 Hempstead, TX
Quality Hot Mix £75.00 $70.00 New Taiton, TX
Pct. #2 Price per ton del. To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Brauntex Materials No bid $62.00 New Braunfels, TX
Waller County Asphalt $86.00 $67.00 Hempstead, TX
Quality Hot Mix $75.00 £70.00 New Taiton, TX
Pct. #3 Price per ton del. To Pct. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Brauntex Materials No bid $62.00 New Braunfels, TX
Waller County Asphalt $75.00 $67.00 Herapstead, TX
Quality Hot Mix $77.00 $70.00 New Taiton, TX
Pct. #4 Price per ton del. To Pet. | Picked Up | Plant Location
Brauntex Materials No bid $62.00 New Braunfels, TX
Waller County Asphalt $79.50 $67.00 Hempstead, TA
Quality Hot Mix £75.00 $70.00 New Taiton, TX
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18. ASHPHALT STABILIZER OR PROVEN EQUAL

Precincts P Squared Emulsions

Asphalt Stabilizer or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

Price per Gal. F.0.B. Plant - Elm Mott, TX $2.44 $2.44 $2.44 $2.44

Price per Gal. F.0.B. Colorado County Area 3$2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69
Precincts

Asphalt Stabilizer or Proven Equal One Two Three Four

Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

Price per Gal. F.Q.B. Plant
Price per Gal. F.0.B. Colorado County Area

Precincts

Asphalt Stabilizer or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

Price per Gal, F.0.B. Plant
Price per Gal. F.Q.B. Colorado County Area

Precincts

Asphalt Stabilizer or Proven Egual One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagie Lake

Price per Gal. F.0.B. Plant
Price per Gal, F.Q.B. Colorade County Area

Precincts

Asphali Stabilizer or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Welmar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

Price per Gal. ¥.0.B. Plant
Price per Gal. F.0.B. Colorado County Area
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19. ASPHALT STABILIZER OR PROVEN EQUAL WiTH PUMP & HOSE

Precincts P Squared Emulsions
Asphalt Stabilizer or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B, Plant _- Elm Mott, TX 5244 $2.44 $2.44 §2.44
Frice per Gal, F.Q.B. Colorado County Area $2.69 3$2.69 $2.69 $2.69
*Pump charge 380
Precincts
Asphalt Stabilizer or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Freishurg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.Q.B. Plant
Price per Gal, F.Q.B, Calorado County Area
Precincts
Asphalt Stabilizer or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.0.B. Plant
Price per Gal. F.Q.B. Colorado County Area
Precincts
Asphalt Stabilizer or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose RockIsland | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorade County Area
Precincts
Asphait Stabillizer or Proven Equai One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Laks
Price per Gal. F.0.B. Plant
Price per Gal. F.0.B. Colorado County Area
18






